Information:

Drawer: Accounts Payable - Invoices
Vendor Number: 1714793
Vendor Name: Theatrical Lighting Connection

Check Detalils:

Check Number: E0109743
Check Amount: $ 17,120.00
Check Date: 9/23/2025

Invoice Details:

Invoice Number: 25-466
Invoice Date: 9/12/2025
PO Number: P0018536
Voucher Number: V0904533

Document Type: AP Invoice

Document Below



T Theatrical Lighting Connection Sales InVOice
HEATRICAL g Mridge. 1L 60527
IGHTING Tel: 1-844-986-8200
ONNECTION Fax: 1-630-986-8219
www.thelightingconnection.com
BILLTO: SHIP To:
Accounts Payable Elias Morales INVOICE NUMBER | CUSTOMER ID
College of Dupage College of Dupage 25-466 CU4198084
425 Fawell Boulevard 425 Fawell Blvd. DATE ORDER NUMBER
Glen Ellyn,IL 60137 Glen Ellyn,IL 60137 09/12/2025 252181
TERMS DUE DATE SALESPERSON PO #
NET 30 10/12/2025 Jimi O'Neill P0018536
JoB SHIP VIA TAX REGION BILL START BILL END
Well Fit X TLC Truck lllinois 09/15/2025 09/15/2025
ltems
Qty Item Description Unit Price Extended
8 Chauvet Well Fit X: 6-Pack 4280.00 17120.00
ltems Total: 17120.00
Summary
Order Comments : Subtotal: 17120.00
Shipping free of charge Shipping: 0.00
Misc: 0.00
Tax: 0.00
Amount Due: $17,120.00
Customer Notes:
PLEASE REMIT PAYMENT TO:

Theatrical Lighting Connection
411 Heathrow Court
Burr Ridge, IL 60527

Please contact accounts receivable at
(630) 986-8200 with any questions or concerns.

Invoices@tlc-chicago.com

PLEASE ENCLOSE COPY OF INVOICE WITH REMITTANCE
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I nvoices <invoices@tlc-chicago.com>

Fwd: Automatic reply: [External] Re: College of DuPage PO No. P0018536 for Chauvet Well Fit X: 6-
Pack

| nvoi ces <invoices@tl c-chicago.com> Fri, Sep 12, 2025 at 08:48 PM UTC
CC: Invoices <invoices@tlc-chicago.com>
BCC:

Thank you for your order from TLC. Attached is a copy of your order invoice. Remit payment at your
earliest convenience.

We are happy to answer any questions or concerns you have with your order. Please contact us at
info@tlc-chicago.com.

Visit our website to see our full inventory at thelightingconnection.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: I nvoices <invoices@tlc-chicago.com>

Date: Fri, Sep 12, 2025 at 3:43PM

Subject: Re: Automatic reply: [External] Re: College of DuPage PO No. P0018536 for Chauvet Well Fit
X: 6-Pack

To: Candace Bennett <Candace@tlc-chicago.com>

Cc: Kevin Casey <caseyk650@cod.edu>, Invoices <invoices@tl c-chicago.com>

Thank you for your order from TLC. Attached is a copy of your order invoice. Remit payment at your
earliest convenience.

We are happy to answer any questions or concerns you have with your order. Please contact us at
info@tlc-chicago.com.

Visit our website to see our full inventory at thelightingconnection.com

On Fri, Sep 12, 2025 at 10:13AM Candace Bennett <Candace@tl c-chicago.com> wrote:
Hello Casey,
Update that the units have finally shipped! They are coming via Saia and have an arrival date of
September 17th.

Tracking info: 121162485002

Candace Bennett
630-986-8200



On Aug 5, 2025, at 11:38, Casey, Kevin <caseyk650@cod.edu> wrote:

Hello,
I will be out of the office on Tuesday, August 5, 2025.
I will respond to your emails when | return on Wednesday, August 6, 2025.

If you need immediate assistance, please contact Amber Kalish at kalisha@cod.edu or at
(6630) 942-2216.

Thank you!

Kevin Casey

Buyer

College of DuPage

425 Fawell Boulevard, IRC 1001

Glen Ellyn, IL 60137-6599

T: (630) 942-2355

F: (630) 942.4201

caseyk650@cod.edu<mailto: caseyk650@cod.edu>

1 attachment

INv#25-466.COD.WellFitX.9-12.paf
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